
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1088917
Vendor Name: Refrigeration Enterprises, Inc.

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106584
Check Amount: $ 1,186.20
Check Date: 3/26/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 122099
Invoice Date: 3/19/2025
PO Number: B0002597
Voucher Number: V0879101

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1







Thu, Mar 20, 2025 at 07:35 PM UTC

"Sekerka, Joyce" <sekerkaj@cod.edu>

FW: [External] RE: Chrome River - Unable to Upload Invoice Images

 <sekerkaj@cod.edu>"Sekerka, Joyce"

CC:

BCC:

Joyce Sekerka 
Accounts Payable Supervisor 
College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd. 
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 
630-942-2293 
Email: sekerkaj@cod.edu 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Maria 
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 2:28 PM 
To: expense-noreply-c5-prod@ca1.chromeriver.com; Sekerka, Joyce 
Subject: [External] RE: Chrome River - Unable to Upload Invoice Images 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or 
respond with sensitive information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

Maria D. Rodriguez 
Refrigeration Enterprises Inc. 
134 East Saint Charles Road 
Villa Park, IL 60181 

Ph: 630-834-6398 Fax 630-834-1052 
http://www.refrigerationenterprises.com/ 

-----Original Message----- 
From: expense-noreply-c5-prod@ca1.chromeriver.com 
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 10:38 AM 
To: sekerkaj@cod.edu 
Cc: Maria 
Subject: Chrome River - Unable to Upload Invoice Images 

Unable to Upload Invoice Images. 

We were unable to upload your invoice images sent on Thursday, March 20, 2025 at 3:38 PM from 
Maria@refrigerationenterprises.com because we did not receive any files. 



Please attach invoice images and send again. 

File must be sent in .pdf, .png, or .jpeg formats and must be less than 10MB. 

2 attachments

122099.pdf

122100.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1088917
Vendor Name: Refrigeration Enterprises, Inc.

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106584
Check Amount: $ 1,186.20
Check Date: 3/26/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 122100
Invoice Date: 3/19/2025
PO Number: B0002597
Voucher Number: V0879106
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Thu, Mar 20, 2025 at 07:35 PM UTC

"Sekerka, Joyce" <sekerkaj@cod.edu>

FW: [External] RE: Chrome River - Unable to Upload Invoice Images

 <sekerkaj@cod.edu>"Sekerka, Joyce"

CC:

BCC:

Joyce Sekerka 
Accounts Payable Supervisor 
College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd. 
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 
630-942-2293 
Email: sekerkaj@cod.edu 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Maria 
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 2:28 PM 
To: expense-noreply-c5-prod@ca1.chromeriver.com; Sekerka, Joyce 
Subject: [External] RE: Chrome River - Unable to Upload Invoice Images 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or 
respond with sensitive information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

Maria D. Rodriguez 
Refrigeration Enterprises Inc. 
134 East Saint Charles Road 
Villa Park, IL 60181 

Ph: 630-834-6398 Fax 630-834-1052 
http://www.refrigerationenterprises.com/ 

-----Original Message----- 
From: expense-noreply-c5-prod@ca1.chromeriver.com 
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 10:38 AM 
To: sekerkaj@cod.edu 
Cc: Maria 
Subject: Chrome River - Unable to Upload Invoice Images 

Unable to Upload Invoice Images. 

We were unable to upload your invoice images sent on Thursday, March 20, 2025 at 3:38 PM from 
Maria@refrigerationenterprises.com because we did not receive any files. 



Please attach invoice images and send again. 

File must be sent in .pdf, .png, or .jpeg formats and must be less than 10MB. 

2 attachments

122099.pdf

122100.pdf
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